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NOTES TO CONSOLIDATED FINANCIAL STATEMENTS 
 
 
10. Investment Securities and Investment Income, continued  

 
A. Marketable Securities, continued 

 
The Company classifies these marketable securities as available for sale.   At December 
31, 2006 and 2005, the Company carried securities that had been in an unrealized loss 
position for longer than twelve months with a total fair value of $101.4 million and $87.5 
million, respectively. Unrealized losses related to these securities were $1.9 million and 
$1.7 million at December 31, 2006 and 2005, respectively. The Company views these 
losses as resulting from market conditions and believes them to be temporary.  At 
December 31, 2006, the Company recorded a loss of $17,640 on one security, for which 
it believes the value it previously recorded to be “other than temporarily impaired.” No 
such losses were recorded in 2005. 

                                                                                          
B.  Alternative Equity Investments 

 
Alternative equity investments include positions in entities that focus predominantly on 
publicly announced mergers and acquisitions arbitrage.  Substantially all of the 
investments made by these entities are in publicly traded securities, and the Company has 
the contractual right to withdraw its funds from these entities each year.  At December 
31, 2006 and 2005, the Company’s recorded equity in these alternative equity 
investments, which includes realized and unrealized gains, was $38,806,303 and 
$25,566,945, respectively.  The cost of these investments was $26,000,000 and 
$16,000,000 in 2006 and 2005, respectively.  
 
Other alternative equity investments include privately held common stocks, preferred 
stocks, surplus notes, and partnership entities investing in companies that are not publicly 
traded.  The Company’s recorded equity in such investments amounted to $36,022,135 
and $24,742,093 at December 31, 2006 and 2005, respectively.  The Company recorded 
unrealized gains of $0 and $5,800 associated with these investments as of December 31, 
2006 and 2005, respectively.  The costs of all such investments as of December 31, 2006 
and 2005 were $36,022,135 and $24,736,293, respectively.  These amounts include 
investments in Direct Response Corporation and Homesite Group Incorporated totaling 
$11.3 million at December 31, 2006 and 2005.  These companies derive underwriting 
revenue from personal lines property and casualty insurance activity throughout the 
United States, except in certain New England states.   

 
The Company has remaining committments to invest $1.7 million and $19 million in two 
private equity funds, Lindsay Goldberg & Bessemer L.P. I (Fund I) and Lindsay 
Goldberg & Bessemer L.P. II (Fund II), respectively.  The Company is a limited partner 
of both Fund I and Fund II.  The Chairman of the Company is a member of the general 
partner of both Fund I and Fund II.  At December 31, 2006, the Company had invested 
$8.3 million and $1.0 million in Fund I and Fund II, respectively. 
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